
 

CERTIFICATE OF NON-DISCRIMINATION 

 

By submission of this Request for Proposal, the contractor (NAME OF FIRM) 

 

certifies that he/she/it does not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment 
on the grounds of race, age, color, national origin, religion, sex, disability, genetic information, or 
any other classification protected by federal, Tennessee state constitutional, or statutory law; 
and does not and will not maintain or provide for his/her/its employees any segregated facilities 
at any of his/her/its establishments; and further, that he/she/it does not permit his/her/its 
employees to perform their services at any location under his/her/its contract where segregated 
facilities are maintained. 

 

CONTRACTOR’S NAME 

 

SIGNATURE 

 

DATE 

 

Printed or Typed Name of Individual Signing for the Contractor 

 

 

 

 

 



 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL AGREEMENT 

 

In compliance with the Request for Proposal, in consideration of the detailed description 
attached hereto; and subject to all conditions thereof, the undersigned agrees, if this Request 
for Proposal be accepted, to furnish any or all services upon which prices have been quoted in 
accordance with the specifications applying at the price set opposite each item. The 
undersigned further agrees, if awarded an order or contract, to protect, defend and hold 
harmless The City of Mount Pleasant from any suits or demands for payment that may be 
brought against it for the use of any product or article that becomes a part of an order or 
contract, and further agrees to indemnity and hold harmless The City of Mount Pleasant from 
any suits or actions of every nature and description brought against it for, or on account of, any 
injuries or damages received or sustained by any party or parties, or his servants or agents in 
the course of fulfilling the terms of the contract and/or Request for Proposal.  

 

NAME OF FIRM 

 

ADDRESS 

 

CITY      STATE    ZIP 

 

Authorized Representative Signature 

 

Terms 

 

Phone Fax Number 

 

E-Mail Address 

 

Date 



 

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT 

 

This Hold Harmless Agreement is between 

 

Name of Contractor 

(hereinafter Contractor, and the School District named in this Request for Proposal. Contractor 
agrees that as a condition precedent to “Contractor” being awarded a contract from the City of 
Mount Pleasant “Contractor” agrees to indemnify, protect, defend, and hold harmless The City 
of Mount Pleasant, its Board of Commissioners, agents, and employees from all judgments, 
claims, demands for payment, suits or actions of every nature and description brought against 
the City of Mount Pleasant, its Board of Commissioners, agents and employees alleging injuries 
or damages sustained by any person arising out of or in the course of the “Contractor’s” 
providing goods or services to the City.  

 

BY:         

TITLE:        

 

State of Tennessee 

County of Maury 

         Personally appeared before me, the 
undersigned, with whom I am personally acquainted and who, upon oath, acknowledged that 
he/she/it executed the within instrument for the purposes therein contained, and who further 
acknowledge that he/she/it is authorized to execute this interment on behalf of  

          . 

 

Signature 

Witness by hand and Notaries seal at office this    day of    , year 
of 2019. 

 

Notary Public 

 

My Commission Expires:            


